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Slow Italian, Fast Learning 
 
Ep.370: Heritage listing is no drag for iconic Sydney hotel 

Italian English 
 

All'Imperial Hotel di Erskineville, sobborgo di 
Sydney, è tempo di festeggiare. 

La Ministra dell’Heritage Penny Sharpe ha 
dichiarato che l'hotel è stato appena inserito 
nel New South Wales Heritage Register. 
  
 
"The State Heritage Register gives special 
recognition to buildings but also to places. 
And what it does is it tells the story of what 
has been important to various 
communities. It's not just about old 
buildings. And the listing... of the Imperial 
Hotel really recognises its very rich queer 
history." 

Questa importante storia è vasta e articolata. 

Tanto per cominciare, l'Imperial Hotel 
compare nell'amato film Priscilla la regina del 
deserto. 

Qui ogni sabato sera si svolge uno spettacolo 
di drag queen ispirato al film. 

Ma l'hotel è stato anche il cuore della 
comunità LGBTQI+ di Sydney per decenni, da 
quando è stato rilevato nel 1983 
dall'imprenditrice locale Dawn O'Donnell, un 
anno prima che lo Stato depenalizzasse 
l'omosessualità, ma in un momento in cui la 
lotta della comunità per l'uguaglianza era già 
ben avviata. 

 La performer Miss 3-D ha lavorato per 
diversi anni per Dawn, prima dell'arrivo della 
O'Donnell nell'inner west. 

 

 

Here at the Imperial Hotel in the Sydney 
suburb of Erskineville, it's time to celebrate. 
  
Heritage Minister Penny Sharpe says the hotel 
has just been listed on the New South Wales 
Heritage Register. 
  
 
"The State Heritage Register gives special 
recognition to buildings but also to places. 
And what it does is it tells the story of what 
has been important to various communities. 
It's not just about old buildings. And the 
listing... of the Imperial Hotel really 
recognises its very rich queer history." 
  
 
That important history is vast and varied. 
  
To begin with, the Imperial Hotel features in 
the beloved 1994 film The Adventures of 
Priscilla, Queen of the Desert. 
  
And a live drag show inspired by the film is 
performed here every Saturday night. 
  
But the hotel has also been at the heart of 
Sydney's LGBTQI+ community for decades, 
since it was taken over in 1983 by local 
businesswoman Dawn O'Donnell, a year 
before the state decriminalised homosexuality 
- but at a time when the community's fight for 
equality was already well underway. 
  
 
Performer Miss 3-D once worked for several 
years for Dawn, before Ms O'Donnell's arrival 
in the inner west. 
  
 
 



 

 
Miss 3-D dice di non aver perso tempo a 
trasformare l'hotel in un centro vibrante per 
la comunità LGBTIQ+.  
 
"Apparently it was quite a working class 
pub before she took it over. And she really 
changed the whole face of the gay scene, 
Dawn did. On Oxford Street and here as 
well." 
  
La deputata di Sydney Tanya Plibersek ha 
affermato che l'inserimento nell'elenco 
celebra l'importanza dell'hotel come locale 
queer-friendly più longevo al di fuori di 
Oxford Street.  
 
"It's an iconic Sydney venue that tells a very 
important story about how our city has 
changed... This goes along with the 
Commonwealth's support for the listing of 
the original 1978 Mardi Gras route on the 
Commonwealth heritage list. It's so 
important to tell the story of all our 
communities in Sydney and in Australia, 
and the history of the LGBTIQ plus 
community in Sydney is an important to tell 
and to preserve." 
 
Oltre all'importanza per la comunità, il 
ministro dell'Economia notturna John 
Graham spera che l'inserimento nell'elenco 
porti dollari al turismo della città, che 
secondo alcuni ha ancora bisogno di una 
spinta dopo il COVID.  
 
"Sydney's night time economy is bouncing 
back. This is a big moment to market. We've 
lost some of our music heritage recently. 
I'm thinking about the Burwood home of 
the Young brothers from AC/DC. 
Demolished actual notes, to be replaced by 
a development. We really need to market 
better; that's why today is so significant. It's 
part of a broader plan to represent our 
music history, our venue heritage, across 
Sydney." 
 

 
Miss 3-D says she wasted no time in 
transforming the hotel into a vibrant hub for 
the LGBTIQ plus community.  
  
"Apparently it was quite a working class pub 
before she took it over. And she really 
changed the whole face of the gay scene, 
Dawn did. On Oxford Street and here as 
well." 
  
Sydney MP Tanya Plibersek says the listing 
celebrates the hotel's significance as the 
longest-running queer-friendly venue outside 
Oxford Street. 
  
 
"It's an iconic Sydney venue that tells a very 
important story about how our city has 
changed... This goes along with the 
Commonwealth's support for the listing of 
the original 1978 Mardi Gras route on the 
Commonwealth heritage list. It's so 
important to tell the story of all our 
communities in Sydney and in Australia, and 
the history of the LGBTIQ plus community in 
Sydney is an important to tell and to 
preserve." 
  
Besides its community significance though, 
Night Time Economy Minister John Graham 
hopes the listing will bring tourism dollars to 
the city - which some say still needs a boost 
after COVID. 
  
 
"Sydney's night time economy is bouncing 
back. This is a big moment to market. We've 
lost some of our music heritage recently. I'm 
thinking about the Burwood home of the 
Young brothers from AC/DC. Demolished 
actual notes, to be replaced by a 
development. We really need to market 
better; that's why today is so significant. It's 
part of a broader plan to represent our music 
history, our venue heritage, across Sydney." 
 
 



 

 
Tutto questo significa che, alla fine dei conti, 
l'Imperial Hotel sarà riconosciuto e 
preservato per le generazioni future - così 
dice Miss 3D. 
 
"The whole of Oxford Street and this place 
really started taking off right through the 
80s. And now, it's bigger than ever." 
  
 

 
All of this means, when all is said and done, 
the Imperial Hotel will be recognised and 
preserved for future generations - so says 
Miss 3D. 
  
"The whole of Oxford Street and this place 
really started taking off right through the 
80s. And now, it's bigger than ever." 
  

 
 
 
 
 
Report by Deborah Groarke for SBS News. 
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